
Submitter 
Number

Comment Officer Comment 

1 Non-Objection Noted.

2 Objection Increased Nosie:

The applicant has provided an acoustic 
assessment that has been prepared by 
a suitably qualified acoustic engineer. 
This report assessed the noise 
emissions from the equipment used 
against the limits prescribed within the 
Environmental Protection (Noise) 
regulations 1997. The report 
concluded that subject to 
implementing operational and 
engineering controls, the development 
would comply with these limits. A 
condition has been imposed to ensure 
that these recommendations are 
implemented prior to commencing the 
business. 

Increased Traffic 

The applicant has indicated that he 
does not wish to have people 
attending his property and is therefore 
offering collection and delivery for all 
items so there will be no additional 
volumes of traffic associated with this 
development. 
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Nature of business amenity 
impacts

The land use ‘Home Business’ is 
intended to allow for small scale 
commercial activities to occur in 
residential areas without compromising 
the amenity of the neighbouring 
properties. The business is considered 
to be low scale and is compliant with 
the relevant planning legislation. 

Bushfire Risk

A Home Business is considered minor 
development under the Guidelines for 
Planning in Bushfire Prone Areas and 
as such the proposal will not 
significantly increase the bushfire risk 
for the area.

Contravention of Council by-Laws

The application is considered a Home 
Business by virtue of its small scale 
and whilst the business does include 
manufacturing and repairing 
components it is considered a Home 
Business and is capable of being 
approved. The City refused an 
application for a similar land use and 
were challenged through the State 
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Administrative Tribunal, whereby the 
Tribunal disagreed with the City’s 
reasons for refusal, for more 
information please refer to paragraph 
12 under the details and analysis 
section of the council report. 

Noted. 

3 Objection
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The applicant will be using the 
outbuilding located toward the eastern 
lot boundary marked ‘Existing Garage’ 
on the site plan, please refer to 
attachment 1 of the council report.

Under no circumstances will the 
applicant be discharging firearms on 
the subject property. 

The proposal does not seek to have 
customer visiting the site, he offers 
collection and delivery for all items. 

The applicant has provided an acoustic 
assessment that has been prepared by 
a suitably qualified acoustic engineer. 
This report assessed the noise 
emissions from the equipment used 
against the limits prescribed within the 
Environmental Protection (Noise) 
regulations 1997. The report 
concluded that subject to 
implementing operational and 
engineering controls, the development 
would comply with these limits. A 
condition has been imposed to ensure 
that these recommendations are 
implemented prior to commencing the 
business. 
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4. Non-Objection
Noted. 
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5.
Objection

a) No comments provided 

Noted. 

6.
Non-Objection. Noted. 
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7. Objection.

In addition to the above, if people park out the front of my property my dogs will bark and do not want to 
annoy my neighbours or endanger my dogs by people reacting badly. 

The proposal does not seek to have 
customer visiting the site, he offers 
collection and delivery for all items. 

The applicant has provided an acoustic 
assessment that has been prepared by 
a suitably qualified acoustic engineer. 
This report assessed the noise 
emissions from the equipment used 
against the limits prescribed within the 
Environmental Protection (Noise) 
regulations 1997. The report 
concluded that subject to 
implementing operational and 
engineering controls, the development 
would comply with these limits. A 
condition has been imposed to ensure 
that these recommendations are 
implemented prior to commencing the 
business. 
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